NORTH BEACH WATER DISTRICT
WATER SUPPLY AND TREATMENT PROJECT

BID RESULTS
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1 University Mechanical Contractors, Inc. (2) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/A| N/A
2 Rognlin's, Inc. (3) $1,355,978.47 $822,082.80 $32,340.00 $2,210,401.27 Y Y Y
3 Pease & Sons, Inc. (4) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/A| N/A
4 Rotschy, Inc. (5) $1,291,729.67 $729,444.87 $19,404.00 $2,040,578.54 Y Y Y
5 McClure & Sons, Inc. (6) $1,404,802.00 $788,449.00 $48,510.00 $2,241,761.00 Y Y Y
6 Award Construction (7) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/A| N/A
7 Pacific Crest Construction, Inc. (9) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/JA| N/A
8 2KG Contractors (13) $1,454,941.03 $834,944.42 $36,158.28 $2,326,043.73 Y Y Y
9 JMG Constructors, LLC (14) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/JA| N/A
10 HB Hanson Construction (16) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/A| N/A
11 Nutter Corporation (17) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/JA| N/A
11 Olympic Peninsula Constrcution (21) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/A| N/A
12 Quigg Brothers (23) $1,678,230.40 $836,819.06 $45,276.00 $2,560,325.46 Y Y Y
13 Nova Contracting, Inc. (24) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A | N/A| N/A
14
15
16
17
18
20 Engineer's Estimate $1,040,000.00 $591,000.00 $22,000.00 $1,653,000.00




